7.1.2 BILLS

Alternate sources of energy and energy conservation measures

1 Solar power generation CLICK HERE
2 Solar DC cable CLICK HERE
3 BLDC 5 star fans CLICK HERE
4 BLDC 5 star fans and 22W LED batten CLICK HERE
5 LED tube Sets CLICK HERE
6 Hitachi Split AC CLICK HERE
7 LED Full Hd display panel CLICK HERE
8 LED tube & bulb kits CLICK HERE

9 Biogas Painting CLICK HERE

Remuneration for resource persons of energy
10 CLICK HERE

efficient systems work shop

Management of the various types of degradable and non-degradable waste

1 E Waste bins CLICK HERE
2 Biogas Plant tank cleaning and repairing CLICK HERE
3 Bio waste management CLICK HERE

4 Waste pit CLICK HERE
Water conservation

1 Harvesting Storage Tank CLICK HERE

2 5000Ir Water Tank CLICK HERE

3 Rain Water Plumbing line work material CLICK HERE




Plumbing & Maintenance work receipt

Remuneration for resource persons of water and

waste management

Green campus initiatives

Purchase of earthen planter pot
Plant name board

Grass cutting

Medicinal plant seedlings
Paints for earthen pots

Potting mixture

Labour charge

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE

Disabled-friendly, barrier free environment

Ramp work

Story teller online payment receipt

CLICK HERE

CLICK HERE




F ROCKY ENGINEERING CO.

1st Floor Matha Tower, Thamarassery o
Thamarassery P.O, Kozhikode - 673573
BACK TO TOP
Phone No: 0495-2224378, 8606040977
E-mail: rockyengineering16@gmail.com
GSTIN : 32BOJPS2079K1Z} iisvnlce Rlos REC/INV/2018-19/66
PAN: BOJPS20789K Invoice Date: 29-03-2019
W.0.No:
S W.O.Date:
Details of Receiver Details of Consignee
Name: Providence Womens College
Address: Malaparamba, Kozhikode )
State: Kerala
State Code: 32
GSTIN : 32AAICM1777D1ZN
INVOICE
:LO DESCRIPTION HSNCODE | UNIT | QTY RATE AMOUNT
1 |30KW ON GRID SOLAR POWER SYSTEM
30KW ON GRID Solar Power Generating System
consisting of 325W/24V 72C poly crystalline PV
modules- 96 nos, 20KW Grid Tie Inverter- 1no,
1.1 |10Kw Grid Tie Inverter - 1no, AC DB, DC DB - 2 nos, 8541 Set ¢ Rs. 15,94,740.00 Rs. 15,94,740.00
4/6sqmm UV protected DC cables and MC4
connectors with MRF coat painted MS structural
support.
yusmipd doj ppssey
mnﬂ g s e DI" al advantg amo U"\-"
gl Ior paymen lof TRs|9,00,00 e
\
by cheqye ne 82i3gay did|2tl3
1 -1 - ¢
Bill passed for Rs. M4 12 . / Q¢ . 7,4
Paid by cheque NO......cccruseesers ;"8 ol 823
O (7 L 2_‘”3 l L‘i
ROVIDENCE WOMEEN'S COLLEGF
(pali )
b rincinGRAND TOTAL R8!#/94,740.00
SGST at 2.5% Rs. 39,868.50
CGST at 2.5% Rs. 39,868.50
NET TOTAL Rs. 16,74,477.00
ROUND OFF Rs. 16,74,477
j%ﬂ: Rupees Sixteen Lakhs Seventy Four Thousand Four Hundred and Seventy Seven Only
' Y arletrr Tirmmria . : =
S S Electrical Contractors
(i ] ’\_%;;_,:5 Matha Tower, Thamarassery, Kozhikode

GSTIN: 32B0JPS2079K12)

Proprietor PAN: BOJPS20789K
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KY ENGINEERING CO Ph: 0495-2224378, Mob: 9447 073580
@ T )

First Floor, Matha Tower,
ECTRICAL ENGINEERS & CONTRACTORS THAMARASSERY, Kozhikode - 673 573

N Date: Q'l&%]{ﬁ .....
b i RECEIPT

.........................

.....................................

..................................................................... ()/mccowzz‘of@S‘QK‘AQ"V\g LM
ks Oe Rz M 2t0a-a01q

% ?OO Oﬁ% Asst. F

s A oy *_‘r;\v"\l .‘1“:» ‘-T, ”,“,\
CANCELLED & ooyt

"z

| ¢
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Ph: 0495-2224378, Mob: 9447 073580

AKY ENGINEERING CO. FirstFloor, Matha Tower,

CECTRICAL ENGINEERS & CONTRACTORS ESMARASSER yikozilkods =673 573

" No 148 Date: ‘3?‘7103][3
, RECEIPT

Receivedwith thanks from M. / Mrs /' \M/s. f 46"'}6[9“'(@ ..... Covaems Qﬁ ....... u °}a-°-_ ........

?

m ..................................................... Siipeesy Sl Jgu ( AR A oo G
........ et b HuduerJ o2l 22 F a5 s 2 lom

QM?/M No: 393859 JdHd as.02-a0Q

R 7’7{9,’4;7;% Asst.P}o.'i\i;:

Pringipal

CANC F LLE D PROVIDENCE glovﬁ-:gs COLLEGE
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4 LLEGE, CALICUT -
CE WOMEN’S COLLEGE, o
PRO\”DE'? 1 For Excellence, Re-Accredited with A+ Grade by N
College with Potentia BACK TO TOP
/ Phone: Principal: +91 495237164

Office :+91 4862372487

Carmel Hill P.0.) Email : providencecollegecalicut@gmail.com
Malaparamba(P. 0.
Kozhikode — 673 009. Date: 2070372019

AWARD OF CONTRACT

ENDER REF NO. A1/PWC/UGC/CPE/XI1/2018-19/1 dated 11" March, 2019
T

TENDER ID 2019 PWC_274698_1
TENDER INVITATION FOR 30KW ON-GRID SPV POWER PLANT

Of the Two Accepted Bids, ROCKY ENGINEERING CO. quoted the least

amount of Rs. 16,74.477/- (Rupees Sixteen lakhs Seventy Four thousand Four

hundred and Seventy Seven only) and hence accepted for the Award of Contract.

e
2l TP
::oi/ \N‘O N}it }\_“{.7‘5‘-.. "‘:.';

S,
\\
N

4 ” C N
_“ f'! % '\-’— 1‘
j (] ‘/ ‘:-‘ :‘_' \
= | (X
A ~Z A fmi
; X /
\,

PROVIDENCE WOMEN'S COLLEG.
Calicut-2



eTendering System Government of Kerala

Tender SUMmary Reports

Date : 20-Mar-2019 &7 ¥

& Print

Organisation Chain :

R .
Providence Wow

Tender 1D :

2019_PWC_274698__1. _

Tender Ref No :

A1/PWC/UGC/CPE/X11/2018-19/ -

https://etenders kerala.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=

%24DirectLink_()&page=TenderStatus&selviqe?dir ect

&session=T

“Oansa, a

- - T

Tender Title :|Tender inviting fmpv POWER PLANT
e e,
Bids List e e e Status Updated On
S.No Bid Number Bidder Name Submitted Date Status == Reason 20-Mar-2019 04:12 PM
1 670875 Alternate Energy Corporation 18-Mar-2019 02:23 PM Rejected-TeCinical Tender forms not uploaded 2019 05,03 P
2 670891 Exact Energy Solutions 18-Mar-2019 02:25 PM Rejected A _ SECOND LOWEST ~ 20-Mar-2019 04:12 PM
3 670795 FERT 18-Mar-2019 01:45 PM Rejected-Tehnical Deviation from the General condior® 20-Mar-2019 04:12 PM
4 670434 INKEL LIMITED 18-Mar-2019 01:03 PM Rejected-Technica) Deviation from the General cond‘tfon: 20-Mar-2019 04:12 PM
5 670819 IT PROFESSIONALS CO-OPERATIVE [18-Mar-2019 01:12 PM Rejected- TENical Deviation from the General condition
' SOCIETY(ITPCOS)LTD.T-1959 o0 20-Mar-2019 06:03 PM
6 670773 Rocky Engineering Co 18-Mar-2019 01:40 PM Accepted'A LOWEST
SN
Bid Opening Summa e
Type :|Finance e~
w
Summary : |A total of si’fw
Updated By : |Sjiji P
.34 PM
Updated On : |{19-Mar-2019 04:32 fg ,
Document : ﬁnance_374%
" rt
BOQ Comparative Chart : |B0Q Comparative &~
_A
Technical Evaluation Summary Details
A
Committee Chairperson/Co-ordinator Name : |Dr Jaseena -12_5_‘;1’,"/\
Committee Chairperson/Co-ordinator Type : [Internal % —ala K, Mr Pradeep Kumar, Mr Divon George
Committee Members : [Ms Shiji P, wr Dr Sini R, Ms Siji AJ, Ms Ninikala
Updated By : |Sjiji P __,_.—m\
Updated On :|20-Mar-2019 0412~
Document : techsummw KB) 8.
T ———
Financial Evaluation Bid List T
___/\
S.No Bid Number Bidder Name  — Value 16,74,477.000L 1
L p70773 Rocky Engineering Co 17,00,999.76L2
E 570891 act Energy Solutions
‘—/\
Finance Evaluation Summary Details
—_A
> ER LY
Committee Chairperson/Co-ordinator Name : [Principal DW
Committee Chairperson/Co-ordinator Type : ivon George
ype !{Internal ___————— - radeep Kumar, Mr Divon Georg
Committee Members :|Ms shij P, Dr 2ngeet=.G Kaimal, br Sini R, Ms, Siji AJ, Ms Ninikata K, Mr P
Updated By : |Sjiji P

20-00.




Page
didering System Government of Kerala

e ——
2019 05:55 PM
"_"-—u—-_.___
Document : {finsummary_374638-PAf (249 49 KB) &
—" m

N

Contract Date :|21-Mar-2019

Updated On :|20-Mar-

L

Contract Value : [INR 1574477_-0_‘2___-~--________

Work Completion Period in days : |12 —— e

Updated By : |Sjiji P oM
Updated on :|20-Mar-2019 06:03
AOC document : awardofcontgc_tfﬂﬂ.g.oa.UB KB) &

bi
AOC Description : |OF the TWO accepted ids, Rocyey ENGINEERING CO quoted the LEAST Amount.

__/\
Awarded Bids List
s.No Bid Number Bidder Name Awarded Currency Avarded Vo Ite

- 670773 Rocky Engineering Co R

1674477.00

Tendering Inviting Authorit

BACK TO TOP

f. in charge of
mgipal




Updated On :

20-Mar-2019 05:55 PM

Document ;

8.pdf a
finsummary_374638.PC1 (249.49 kg) & .

e

>
0

e —

Contract Date ;

21-Mar-2019 e —

Contract Value :

INR1674477.00 ___._

Work Completion Period in days :

Updated By :

Sjiji P

Updated on :

BACK TO TOP

20-Mar-2019 06:03 PM

Of the TWO aWENGINEERING CO quoted the LEAST Amount.

Awarded Value

AOC document : [awardofcontract.pdf (208.03 KB) &..
AOC Description :
_/\‘
Awarded Bids List _
S.No Bid Number Bidder Name AwarcEC Currency
T 670773 Rocky Engineering Co INR

1674477.00

B ookl o o



&7 A PRI . I AlaQ, VOUUC L o4
\ E-Mail : info@pulizventures.com

Receipt Voucher
BACK TO TOP

No. : 5 Dated : 4-Jun-2021
Particulars Amount
Account :
THE PRINCIPAL,Providance Womens College 50,000.00
Through :
Yes Bank Ltd
Amount (in words) :

Fifty Thousand INR Only

|
___50,000.00 ¥

“

Authorised Signatory




BACK TO TOP
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SALES INVOICE

PULIZVENTURES LLP
2{2542K.L. CNARCADE,
FLORICAN ROAD
MALAPARAMBA,

KOZHIKODE,

GSTIN/UIN: 32ZAAYFPE930G1ZV
State Name ;| Kerala, Code © 32
E-Mail : info@pulizventures.com

Buyer

The Principal

Providance Womens College
Malaparamba

Calicut

State Name : Kerala, Code : 32

Invoice No.
PUZ11

Delivery Note

Maode/Terms of Payment

Supplier's Ref.

Other Reference(s)

Buyer's Order No.

Despatch Document MNo.

Dated

Delivery Note Date

Despatched through

Destination

| Terms of Delivery

sl ‘ Description of HSN/SAC KFC Quantity Rate per Amount
Ho. | Goods and Services i . Rais —
| 1 |De Earth Station 85044010 1% :1.00 NOS .| 350000 NOS 3,500.00
Copper DC DB TO GROUND
2 |LIGHTNING ARRESTER 85044010 1% | 2.00 NOS 3,600.00 NOS 7,200.00
SPIKE
3 |WIRE NO.10SWG-COPPER 85044010 1% 23.00 KGS 725.00 KGS 16,675.00
EARTH CONDUCTOR FROM ADDITIONAL
| LA TO EXISTING BOWN CONDUCTOR !
4 |Solar Dc Cable 4.0 Sgqmm Black Color 85044010 1 % |208.000 Mtr 138.00 | Mtr 28,704.00
(2 ROL)
REARRANGEMENTS OF EXISTING DC CIECUIT
{2 RUN 4 SQ MMUY PROTECTED DC CABLE
| ADDITIONAL FOR 10 KW ADDING PANNEL)
5 |bCcDB 85044010 1% |1.00NOS | 18,500.00 |NOS 18,500.00
4 IN 4 OUT 4 NOS FUSE,4 NOS DP |
DC MCB,E NOS SPD | ] |
5 |DCDB |85044010 1% [1.00 NOS | 12,700.00 |NOS | 12,700.00
2 IN 2 OUT 2 NOS FUSE,2 NOS FUSE,2 NO |
2 NOS DP MCB,2 NOS SPD | |
. 87,279.00
Labour Charge 0% 5,000.00
Labour Charge 0% [ 12,000.00
TESTING AND COMMISSIONING 57 11,793.00
continued ...

SUBJECT TO CALICUT JURISDICTION

This is a Computer Generated Invoice

(1)
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SALES INVOICE(Page 2)

ENTURES LLP

2KK,L. CNARCADE,

RICAN ROAD
ALAPARAMBA,

KOZHIKODE,

GSTIN/UIN: 32ZAAYFP6930G 12V
State Name : Kerala, Gode : 32
E-Mail : info@pulizventures.com

Buyer

The Principal

Providance Womens College
|Malaparamba

Invoice No.

Delivery Note

021

s of Payment

Supplier's Ref.

Other Reference(s)

Buyer's Order No.

Despatch Document Na.

Dated

Delivery Note Date

Despatched through

Destination

Calicut
State Name : Kerala, Code : 32 P
iTerms of Delivery
|
|
si Description of | HSN/SAC | KFC | Quantity | Rate |per | Amount
|__1:|._ _Goods and Services | | Rate | | | o
: ggg;@:;ﬁ | 9% 10,446.48
' @9% , 9% 10446.48
f |
| |
|
|
| |
il Total | 1,36,964.96 1
| Amaunt Chargeable (in words) E. & O.F |_
One Lakh Thirty Six Thousand Nine Hundred Sixty Four INR and Ninety Six paise Only
HSN/SAC Taxable - Central Tax State Tax Total
. Value Rate Amount _Rate Amount Tax Amount
B5044010 87,279.00 9% 7,855.11 9% 7,855.11 15,710.22
28783600 9% 2584.57 8% 2,581.37 518274
Total 1,16,072.00 10,446.48 10,446.48 20,892.96
- . _ :
Tax Amount (inwords) :  Twenty Thousand Eight Hundred Ninety Two INR and Ninety Six paise Only 5 \ (i} 3
(,r),,! m (o) &
L
AV
2 ' i [ o=
pulsv 606760
Z VEN T
DR EATALGH. for PULIZ" VE IE‘JRES L
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the QJJ‘N
goods described and that all particulars are true and correcf,, T worised Signalary

SUBJECT TO CALICUT JURISDICTION

This is a Computer Generated Invoice

11}



INDO ELECTRIC MART

Indo Square, Indo Market Road,
Kalluthankadavu, Calicut - 673004
Ph: 0495 2701100, 27011 11
Indo Care : 7664 93 93 93

) S
USTEp SINGE 12°

TAX INVOICE - CASH

al for Buyer

BACK TO TOP

P AKIPS1363A2ZK
#la State Code: 32
info@indoemart.in
www.indoelectricmart.com
sales@indoemart.in

TO : Pricipal Delivery Address Invoice No : B8552
Providence Womens College Invoice Date @ 23-11-2021
PO No.& Date
LR Details :
Due Date : 23-11-2021
Phone sal
State: KERALA RIESHER
State Code: 32 E- way bill No
GSTIN :
Sl | HSN Description Quantity Price Taxable GST Total
Code of Goods Value % | Amount
1 18414 |Crompton Energion HS BLDC 5 Star Brown .~ 2.000NOS| 2534.000 5068.00 18.00 912.24 5980.24
C-Fan 1200mm
| ToTAL 912.24 5980.24
Rupees Five Thousand Nine Hundred Eighty Only
Sales Turnover CGST Amt SGST Amt Round Off : 494
18% 5068.00 456.12 456.12
Bill Amount Z5,980.00

All disputes are subject to KOZHIKODE jurisdiction

Sy
=8 . Central Bank Of India

For INDO ELECTRIC MART

Y
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ORIGIN ENGINEERS )

A-CLASS ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS & ENGINEERS

. ) } BACK TO TOP
27 /' 529, 'Moham’, Near Govt. Mental Hospital Licence No TCA 376
Kuthiravattom. P.O., Kozhikode, Kerala, Pin: 673016 GST IN : 32AADFO 0950A121
Phone/Fax :0495 2741910,E-mail; origin0495@gmail.com PAN : AADFO 0950A
Original for Recipient
TAX INVOICE i
Duplicate for Supplier / Transporter
GSTIN : 32AADFO0950A121 Triplicate for Supplier
Reverse Charge No Transportation Mode
Invoice No VvV 100 Vehicle Number
Invoice Date 30.08.2022. |pate of Supply
State |Code Kerala I 32 |Place of Supply
Details of Receiver / Billed To : Details of Consignee / Shipped to:
Name Principal Name
Providence Women's College,
Address Malaparamba (P.0), Address
Kozhikode - 673 009.
GSTIN Nil GSTIN
State [Code Kerala 32 |State ICode
Sl. it , HSN Taxable CGST SGST IGST
Description of Goods / Services Rate Total
No . ! Code | A Amount | Rate |[Amt. Rate |Amt. Rate [Amt.
1 |Suppy, installation, testing and|995461| 100 3250.00{ 325000.00] 9% | 29250.00f 9%| 29250.00 383500.00
commissioning of 1200 mm sweep
ceiling fan complete with 3 core
round chord wire, 300 mm down
rod, canopies, shackles and blades
working on 230 / 240 v single phase,
BLDC 5 Star rated. (Crompton -
Energeon reveira white)
2 |Suppy, installation, testing and|995461| 120 460.00f 55200.00| 9% 4968.001 9%| 4968.00 65136.00
commissioning of 22W LED batten
complete with all accessories.
(Philips - Starline pro 22 W LED
Batten CDL)
Total 380200.00 34218.00 34218.00 448636.00
Total Invoice Amount in Words: Total Amount before Tax 380200.00
Rupees Four Lakh Forty Eight Thousand Six Hundred and Thirty Six |Add: cGsT 34218.00
Only Add : SGST 34218.00
Bank Details Add : IGST 0.00
Bank Account Number 67225595904 Tax Amount : GST 68436.00
State Bank of India, Total Amount after Tax 448636.00
Bank / Branch Puthiyara Branch, Round Off (-) 0.00
Kozhikode Grand Total 448636.00
IFSC SBIN 0070576 GST Payable on Reverse Charge
Terms and Conditions Certified thatth& particulars given above are true and correct
N~ \ For Origin Engineers
—
Authorised Signatory
\ - (E & OE)
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ORIGIN ENGINEERS A

A-CLASS ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS & ENGINEERS

BACK TO TOP
27 | 529, 'Moham’, Near Govt. Mental Hospital Licence No— i 370
Kuthiravattom. P.O., Kozhikode, Kerala, Pin: 673016 GST IN : 32AADFO 0950A1Z1
Phone/Fax :0495 2741910,E-mail: origin0495@gmail.com PAN : AADFO 0950A
Original for Recipient
TAx lNVOICE Duplicate for Supplier / Transporter
GSTIN : 32AADF00950A171 Triplicate for Supplier
Reverse Charge No Transportation Mode
Invoice No V101 Vehicle Number
Invoice Date 30.08.2022. |Date of Supply
State [Code Kerala I 32 |Place of Supply
Details of Receiver / Billed To : Details of Consignee / Shipped to:
Name Principal Name
Providence Women's College,
Address Malaparamba (P.0), Address
Kozhikode - 673 009.
GSTIN Nil GSTIN
State |Code Kerala L 32 State |Code
2 Description of Goods / Services HSN Qty Rate Taxable St il 61 Total
No Code Amount | Rate |Amt. Rate |[Amt. Rate |Amt.
1 |Part Payment - 4 for the Electrical| 995461| 1 |300000.00( 300000.00] 9% | 27000.00] 9%| 27000.00 354000.00
maodification works for the proposed
additional construction work at
Providence = Women's College,
Malaparamba (P.0), Kozhikode.
Total 300000.00 27000.00 27000.00 354000.00
Total Invoice Amount in Words: Total Amount before Tax 300000.00
Rupees Three Lakh and Fifty Four Thousand Only oo AR000
Add : SGST 27000.00
Bank Details Add : IGST 0.00
Bank Account Number 67225595904 Tax Amount : GST 54000.00
State Bank of India, Total Amount after Tax 354000.00
Bank / Branch Puthiyara Branch, Round Off (-) 0.00
Kozhikode Grand Total 354000.00
IFSC SBIN 0070576 GST Payable on Reverse Gharge
Terms and Conditions Certified that the particulars given above are true and correct
/ For Origin Engineers
\\»,. \ > a /
N Authorised Signatory
- (E&OF)
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GSTIN : 32BFIPS9820]172

BACK TO TOP
UNIVERSAL ELECTRICALS
OPP : LAW COLLEGE,VELLIMADUKUNNU CALICUT
PH : 0495-2732940,8547600485,9446641940
ALL TAX ARE COLLECTED AS PER GOODS AND SERVICE ACT 2017
Invoice No:UE008890 =  cRs . 45 Vate 2Nevaigl
To : PROVIDENCE - Tax Type : GSTR1 B2CS

Place : Kerala - 32
InvTime :9:52: AM

Narration :
MOB . : _Party GSTIN : 2 2 S s -
\ ; [ [ R
No | ItemName HSN | Qty Rate Grossf} Disc Taxable| SGST|  SGST CGST|  CGST Total.
I R S A R ‘ % SRR S | e |
1 | CHANEL SUN 3/4" 853610 | 10.00 59.32 593.22} 0.00  593.22 9.00  53.39  9.00  53.39 700.00
2 | LEGRAND MYLINCIWAY SWICH 853610 | 3.00 @ 29.66 88.98  0.00 88.98 9.00 801 9.00 801 105.00
3 WALL PLUGE 38MM(BOX) 39171010 | 1.00 | 50.85 5085  0.00 50.85 9.00 |  4.58 9.00 | 4.8 60.00
4  POLYCAB LED TUBE SET 24W 4FEET (whiéd)5109 | 3.00 20536 61607  0.000  616.07 6.00 369 600 369 690.00
5 ITOUCH PLATE 3MD M | 853610 | 2.00 = 41.53 83.05 831 7475 900 673900 673 88.20
6 GANG BOX 3MD 85361010 | 2.00  49.15 9831  0.00 98.31 900 885 9.00 885 116.00
| ‘; 1
| 5 |
| |
\ \
'] 1 %
G o " 1 5
o » | s
: u/? | |
\ FP _ | |
= T | 1
e i a
: ‘ 5 |
= |
: .
|
| |
‘ |
1 ; ;
= i, i 25 | :
21.00 153048 831  1522.17 118.51 11851 175920
Tax%  Taxable CGST  SGST ‘
18 906.11 81.56 81.56
12 616.07 36.96 36.96
= Invoice Disc 0.00 % = 0.00 . RoundOF:-020

TOTAL : 1759.00

Rupees One Thousand Seven Hundred Fifty Nine only...

Authorised Signator); 3
-
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_—~ SOUHRDAM TRADERS —

KANNADIKKAL, P.O. VENGERI, KOZHIKODE, PH: 9447776163

| Ne. EQ7 < -- Date. &:3/11)%040).....
To.. %.aumtmm areaa lalleie.. |
. S G Rocps.| R by
15720 «a L ED Tl ShHZD |6y
20 | T ed L ED buls- olooo |4
3
i TOTAL S4HeD o)
E.& OE.

For SOUHRDAM TRADERS
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SUBJECT TO CALICUT JURISDICTION

=
’é 0 Datec{gﬁ-Aug-ZMT

{DﬁARKO SERIES PRODUCTS (P) LTD
2/2038 C,E.K. Complex
Civil Station P.O
Calicut - 673020
GSTIN/UIN: 32AAJCMB668G1Z4
State Name : Kerala, Code : 32
E-Mail : markoseries@gmail.com

Tax Invoice

Party : The Principal Providence College
Malaparamba

State Name  : Kerala, Code : 32

Place of Supply : Kerala

@I T Description of Goods Quantity I Rate ; per Amount
| No. | | ) e e et B s ‘777 9 EE '
-1 | HITACHI SPLlT AIR CONDITIONER 2. 0TON 55 I 5 Nos| 35, 984, 00| Nos 1,79,920.00
2 | SHALIMAR CUT OFF A/C & 5Nos'  1,835.00 Nos | 9,175.00
|3 : MUL TI PURPOSE CLAMP(ANGLE) 5Nos| 1,080.68| Nos 5,403.40
} || 19449840
CGST | : 26,500.86
SGST| ! 26,500.86
| |Less: Round Off (-)0.12
j
|
i 5l
| :
| |
| |
| A L e Lo 2550 g P Wy W
] Total| 15 Nos| I 5 ﬁ 2 47,500.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) 7 EEOE
INR Two Lakh Forty Seven Thousand Five Hundred Only
[ — HSN/SAC " [ Taxable | CentralTax |  SlateTax | Total |
| Value _Rate Amount Rate : Amount Tax Amount |
84158210 0 1,79,920.00, 14% 25,188.80 14% 25,138.80 50,377-60
| 73011000 14,578.40 9% 1,312.06 | 9%[ 1,312.06 2,624.12
i % __ Total| 1,94,498.40| __ 26,500.86, ] _26,500.86 53,001.72

Tax Amount (in words) : INR Flfty Three Thousand One and Seventy Two paise Only
Company's Bank Details

Bank Name : State Bank of India A/c No. 29012

Alc No. : 35229229012 %

Branch & IFS Code: Karaparamba & SBIN0016660 %

Declaration for MARKO SERIES PRODUCTS (P) LTD
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the /

goods described and that all particulars are true and correct.  /

/

This is a Computer Generated Invoice

Has NN
/ Q/ 2/203 38-C, gl
E,\CCM PLE EX, \ 1

u_ smrn pﬂ |

/q: =

WA
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/4 AN
ALY s Y PRODUCTS (P) LIMITED.

SERIES

2/2038C, E.K. Complex, Palattuthazham, Wayanad Road,
~~ Civil Station P.O., Calicut- 673 020, Kerala-India, 0495- 2375764, Mob: 9447075764

www.markoseries.com info@markoseries.com markoseries@gmail.com

Noe 0 RECEIPT Nt [5, /,-_}
Received with thanks from Sn-ASmt/ M/s... C?"a' LML, AQWCQWW,&COHGJC
....... Mdﬂ%]'\w{ cw{fl sy .the sum of Rupees... Yol lakh. Jourt Y-
Lavemn A&\QM Y ule n%—/—%/ Cheque NO= S W St A il s, at.

{OWAITS...oonseeesrmreres \stebee. Moz L0 d&ﬂt

W& «‘:ﬂ s00 /-
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RETAIL INVOICE
/RJYA REPROGRAPHICS BUSINESS SYSTEMS (GST) | Invoice No. Dated
36/1277, KALATHIL THAZHAM C-00073 29-Aug-2017
VENGERI, CALICUT -673010 Supplier's Ref. Other Reference(s)
|Tel : 0495 2378191, Mob : 9447 311 353

(GSTIN/UIN: 32AAQFR4400B12Q _
| E-Mail : riyagroup@eim.ae, riyareprographics@gmail.com

[ Buyer

The Principal '
Providence College, Malaparamba, Kozhikode

S| Description of Goods HSN/SAC |GST Rate| Quantity Rate per Amount
N
1 | Display Panel LG 43" LED Full HD 28%| 1 nos| 53,125.00| nos 53,125.00
CGST 7,437.50
SGST 7,437.50
| Total 1 nos
< 68,000.00

“Amount Chargeable (in words)

E. &OE
. INR Sixty Eight Thousand Only
HSN/SAC Taxable Central Tax State Tax
Value Rate Amount Rate Amount
53,125.00 14% 7,437.50 14% 7,437.50
Total 53,125.00 7,437.50 7,437.50

Tax Amount (in words) : INR Fourteen Thofisand Eight Hundred Seventy Five Only

Fassed for payment =l Principal
Providence Women's College
Calicut - 9

Declaration
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the

goods described and that all particulars are true and
correct.

for RIYA REPROGRAPHICS BUSINESS SYSTEMS (GST) /

BACK TO TOP

This is a Computer Generated Invoice
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— RIYA REPBOGRHPHICS
= BUSINESS SYSTEMS

| Thazham Building, Vengeri ,Calicut - 673010
I- riyareprographics@gmail.com Website : www.riyagroupuae.com

ttappankulam, sulthan Bathery, Ph: 04936 - 224191

4 36 /1277, Kalathi
447 311 353 , 0495 2378191 emai

Br. Office : SBP IV 639 - A S5, Kakk

No. 1021

odan Building, Do

CASHREGEIPT /D/,,fe _ulali

.....................................................
..............................
|

7 &% .00
tto realisation

Subjec
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TRUFL@ ESTIMATE Date 5O ”’1\!111'

Fp 3 — 1
g'ﬂ _,U,C"I'F-lr"l LE‘ n:"',.,“_i:g_ L""'.H_,._::_-',‘f."“'fli o
. | e
iHﬁ.: Itemns / Pam:ulars Qty. Rate | Amnunt
IR
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SRR i ot ol @y e et et
3 vl = 270
% | ] ) |
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ONE DAY TRAINING WORKSHOP ON LED BULB AND TUBE MAKING

STATEMENT OF EXPENDITURE

Bill Item Bill Date Amount in Rs.
No. y
1 Poster printing , Banner & 12-11-2018 1025
certificates
2 LED Tube & LED bulb kits 14-11-2018 13500
3 LED tube and LED bulb kits 16-11-2018 10500
4 Xeroxing of energy survey 16-11-2018 50
form
5 Conveyance for the resource | 17-11-2018 500
person 500
6 Tea & Snacks for the 17-11-2018 850
participants
Ta& Remuneration for the 17-11-2018 6500
£ resource person
iTOTAL 33425
gill passed for R“‘"“”g 16639
paid by cheaue NO-S5E%
Dtd....?e'.-'!\.l.'n\.ﬂ %o'\ ‘
principal 2> Dr. LKfHA. P (Panakkada)

Qo
¢ \00{0\ Hes
.- 0\
o
\‘QO
<

the Department of Physics

Rrovidence Women's College
§aztiikode, Kerala, Pin: 673009
e :
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()VIDENCE WOMEN’S CO
CALICUT -673 009

e -EL‘L ) Lq“m 'P

BACK TO TOP
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OTTOTRACTIONS

AKG ROAD, EDAPPALLY TOLL, KOCHI-682 024, KERALA.
PHONE: 0484-2540130

COST CENTRE:

RECEIPT

Received from....... P'Y:)V\-UIH/DGV] ............................................ Cﬁ‘u.l.y\ No. 260

Rupees in words........ T&)"'ua\_ B 4

-

!. . {} f e, ;_._L.,*i_.:
Prepared by _ L w
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PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE
CALICUT -673 009 {

................................................................................................................................................................................

-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Claek Congo |lnt Y Shocliey
SRL A 2 g%ff\t.mw\%(ﬂw p-0
oo
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ORIGINAL FOR RECIPIENT

Green Worms Eco Solutions LLP

3/460 D, PONOOR
UNNIKULAM PO

KOZHIKODE
@ Kerala 673574
%%En%g GSTIN: 32AAOF(38683M1ZN
N A CIN: AAC-9120

Tax Invoice
INVOICE NO. 2152
INVOICE TO
DATE 21/03/2019 |
Providence Women's College | |
DUE DATE 21/03/2019 .

ba PO
Malaparamba TERMS Due on receipt

Calicut |
673009
PLACE OF SUPPLY
32 - Kerala
NO HSN/SAC DATE ACTIVITY QTY RATE AMOUNT TAX
1 3924 21/03/2019 E WASTE BIN 3 3,000.00 9,000.00 18.0%
Large GST
2 3924 21/03/2019  E WASTE BIN 1 2,500.00 2,500.00 18.0%
Medium
GST
CGST @ 9% on 9745.76 877.12
'm p'“.d for Rslll.s..ﬁ.f 4o SGST @ 9% on 9745.76 877.12
Paid by chaque No..Z.23.2.33 TOTAL 11,500.00
223219 BALANCE DUE
g { ?1 1’500.00
Principal
. ,gf«wm%é’f’j\
Assi. Fidl. infcharge of
Pracipal

PROVIDENCE WOMEN'S COLLEGE

Accoun&%it'a Flsjt -9
Alc No: 917020028778788, IFSC Code: UTIB0000136, Branch: Axis Bank Westhill Branch Kozhikode
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RECEIPT

=P

Received with thanks from The Principal, Providence Women’s
College. Calicut, a sum of Rs. 11,500/~ (Rupees Eleven Thousand and Five
Hundred Only) towards Purchase of Electronic Waste Collection Bins in

connection with E-Waste Management (Cheque No. 823833 dated:

21/03/2019)

= ee/\rag,' <

Date: &/-03-19

P D-‘ = ‘I_,-h'v’I/Ouwe/_\—-\
Asst. Prof{in ¢har
Prinzipal 9o

PROVIDENCE WOMEN'S COLLEGE
Calicut-9

CANCELLED:
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AWARE

Agency for Water Management Agricultural Rural Engineering &Re-Energy.

RN-61,CH Fly Over,Near Income Tax Office.

No. A /RZKKD/20/2019-20

Received with thanks from

The Sum of

By

Remarks

RS.49,000/-

Calicut-673001

RECEIPT

Date.15.02.2020

The Hostel Warden

Providence women’s college

Malppparamba,Kozhikode
Forty nine thousand
Rupees only

Cheque
(N0.100021, Dtd.05.02.2020)

Biogas plant outlet tank

Cleqning& repairing work,

Advance payment

For AWARE

Secreta

12
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Agency for Water Management Agricultural Rural Engineering &Re-Energy

AWARE

RN-61,CH Fly Over,Near Income Tax Office.
Calicut-673001

No.A/S1/04/1920/S1-2 Date.15.02.2020.

Invoice (Service)

Si No Item/Work Amount
Carriage and dumping slurry of biogas plant Bio gas
plant pressure head tank sock pit, top to earth, Earth
work for disposing bio gas waste with clearing of site ,
Constructing manhole upper the digester dome
((without manhole cover),supply new CPVC valves,
1 fittings, Supply and fixing approved standard 82755/-
Manometer and pressure Regulating Device for Dome
Type plant, Supply and fixing condensate Traps type
Flame Arrester, Supply and fitting Bio Gas Burner
heavy industrial type (1 Nos) Utility Quality stove,
Apply of Bio Enzyme and removing and refixing sign
boards sticker including all labour charge

If applicable 18% GST will be charged

(Rupees eighty two thousand seven hundred and fifty five only)
TR A ey

iR DR *

p g irector
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PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE

CALICUT - 673 009
’ Date.29:83:19

Received with thanks from .. fpamacy pad. . /mm derve... |aoraens.. calles:
T 0 TR R T P U ———

the sum ofRupees....vglM‘.y...... SONASEA NG ..
Xw—wm/fMWgemW .........................................................

....a.h&ak..m.ﬁ:...x&g,gt%’.g

/ /—em\

Rs 50/ CDOO/-—- r/ ‘iﬁ /‘ 'i'T"L“ .\"
° { &} A} s § 1

l\‘ - .i *}—4‘}.{!

\ /T ./

A e ¢ o
Maol. o ;

] CANCELLED

FRBMIGENCE WOMEN' COLLEGF
Calicutg
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MOM INDIA
Kozhikode Mob: 9846701276
Date: 03/01/2019
SI. No. Description Amount
1 Fish pond 21,500
2 Grow bed 10,100
3 Bio filter tank 3,500
4 NFT 3,000
5 Water aeration 2,300
6 Plumbing & electrical 2,400
7 Submersible water pump 2,100
8 Fish seeds 1,100
9 Vegetable seeds 800
10 Black soldier fly compost tank 3,200
Total 50,000
(Fifty Thousand Only)

5 ool

-----------

. pill passed for Rs.. 9&3?1 ~

" Ppaid by cheque No.
Did.a1314-..

Principal

Asst. Frof.

FINCT

PROVIDENCE WOMEN'S COLLEGF
Calicut-9

1erge of




}_ PKE i

(dlem @20
NSWMUMD |
CUGEBBRM |.ai1.630.

CHIY1680IS.10 @ lgm] :  18/12/2020

alatdllwmdm’ eoegem Waste pit mldex e mamow]
G2egE 1@ mImy (Rs 33,200/ eyajo0laymoe oo 80
03 I®YOS 6.2186) (cheque No.100034) @15 eoniowafl@lenm,
mldendem aflainilmonie (@ materials bills e oMo

O 2flg 6ns
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: | I
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VENGERI PLUMBING EN TERPRISES

Vengeri, Calicut-673 010, Ph: 9895201429, 9846554436

Date. 23/’0’52/ 19
Rain WatAf:DQer Harvesting Storage Tank - Work Done Statement

Vr. No Date Particulars Arr;c;t-mt
1 25.02.2019 Cement.p.p.c, Cement Slag 4000/-

2 26.02.2019 5000 Ltr Water tank(Black) 58,528/-
Shinkar XT emlsn maron 1 Ltr,Bp 340/-

3 27.02.2019 brush 4 Wilsin Silk

Runktank Connector,Runs ABS lever
handle,pp-50mm pvc pipe 6kg,Hack
saw blade,Well bomd 50 mi,Pvc Soc
4 27.02.2019 star,pp 32mm pvc pipe 10kg,pvc 1007/-/-
ELBOW,Bend,63mmFinolex ISI pvc
pipedjg, 1110mm Finolex Isi pvc Pipe

4kg
5 28.02.2019 Pvc Pipe flow well 110mm 4 kg 550/-
6 28.02.2019 Pvc elbow star,nails 2,PP32mm pvc 155/-
Pipe 10 kg
7 26.02.2019 Flore Foundation work- labour 9000/-
8 Soil Filling Work-Labour 5100/-
10 Congreting Work-Labour 3600/-
11 Wall Plastering-Labour 3600/-
12 Tank Setting Work-Labour 4000/-

: ‘or Vengeri Plumbing Enm}/@ﬁ,

i_}‘ o d

AR AR ERILED
PROVIDEMCE WOMEN'S COLLE sF
Cancut-3
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VENGERI PLUMBING ENTERPRISES

Vengeri, Callcut 673 010, Ph: 9895201429, 9846554436

BACK TO TOP

Date. 2\8/ 03] 1 !

13 i Pipe & Valvu seting work-Labour 2000/-
14 Bricks-150 4800/-
15 Sand-22 feet 1320/-
16 Cement -Transporting 250/-
17 Bricks-Transporting 250/-
18 Water tank-Transporting 500/-
TOTAL ( 99000/-

PROVIDENCE NOM::.

I'S COLLEGE

For Vengeri Plumbing Enterprises

Par

s
S’




PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLL

CALICUT - 673 009
' Date.02 8 pa? Jﬁ/?

...............................................................................................................................................

the sum ofRupeest@éWmZOMM/ﬂnégwm%%
wﬁf//ﬂmawafa@vwz%ydz@ayx e S
........ heguas. Moz SLET0..... ezt 80RO

FASAL ~ e P

. v ] T )
AssT Frol. ing] mgeﬁp Asst_Prof. in charge of
- Principal ipal
CANCELLED PROVIDENCE WOMEN'S COLLEGE PROVIDENCE WO EPS\aQu 6
Calizut-2 Caiiouls
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Tax Invoice

Pride Business Corporation Invoice No.

Moothat Triangle, Vengeri Jn 3022
Recp : 8157000017 Delivery TNots < o
Cus?Care : 703410001 153 : L ‘ ode/Terms of Payment |

Billing Sec : 70341000 . -

Diri"egr : 7034100012 'Supplier's Ref. 'Other Reference(s)
 GSTIN/UIN: 32BHYPSD1§81.(;§N i‘ % % . _ |
%’f;fr Name : Kerala, Code . Biyers Ofder o, : I‘ Dated ™ : ‘
'PROVIDENCE WOMENS COLLEGE ‘ |
| MALAPARAMBE Despatch Document No. Delivery Note Date l
' State Name : Kerala, Code : 32 |

Despatched through Destination f

; |

Terms cf Delivery i

|

|

| |

‘Sﬁh Description of Goods HSN/SAC | Quantity | Rate per | Disc. % Amount :
i No. l | [ |

. . | |

'1 | 5000 Ltr Witank Pride(Black) 39251000 | 10,000 Itr 496 Itr 49,600.00

1 ' | I

l ‘ |

n SasT | o b 4,464.00

| ‘ O 9% 4,464.00

|

| [P
~i | | ! AS‘S/ ('J]:_l | f‘-EJ'gF o f

| | | | ringipsl

B | | PROVIDENGE V("

! ‘ (9"

L

Total 10,000 Itr % 58.528.00

"Amount Chargeable (in words) (525,00

' Indian Rupees Fifty Eight Thousand Five Hundred Twenty Eight Only |

g HSN/SAC Taxable Central Tax ' State Tax [ Total

" Value Rate | Amount | Rate [ Amount | Tax Amount

139251000 4960000 O%|  4464.00] 9%  4464.00  8928.00

i Total|  49,600.00 4,464.00 4,464.00]  8,928.00

[Tax Amount (in words) : Indian Rupees Eight Thousand Nine Hundred Twenty Eight Only

s
|

. i
' for Pride Business Corporation~
|

Company's VAT TIN : 32110770249 ;
| Declaration oo
'RECEIVED GOODS IN GOOD CONDITION BUS'”ESSL@&R

- E O AUHORBGR AT
This is a Computer Generated Invoice 3 Yepass Road, Vengeri Jn. Eait‘gf

2 = FEB 7919

|

CASH

_RECEIVE
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Three Star - i S.K.Tempie

PROVIDENCE COLLAGE
KOZHIKODE.

Road Near Corporation Stadiam, Kozhikode-

e i
8731

B

24/06/2021

%\;

J

Near Comorstion Madium Cabicu
Pl 9847884049 oomaEns

.~
3 7

CHARGE BILL
SL ’\
NO ' DISCRIPTION UNIT | QTY | RATE | AMOUNT
1 _WESHNW:OMMITIONIG
PVC PIPE AND FITTINGS (TEES,BENDS,COUPLERS,
SOLVENT CEMENT) ETC. )
A, | 6”DIA PVC 4KG PIPE MTR | 120 | 1200 | 144000
SUPPORT BRAKET :
2 SUPPLY AND FIXING ( 2mm RAIL, TREDED ROD, NO |80 |320 |25600
' ANCHOR FASTNER, NUT WASHER, CLAMPS ) ETC.
3, 6” CORE CUTTING HOLE AND RE-MAKING NO 10 400 4000
(INCLUDING CORE FILLING COMPOUND GP-2)
4 SUPPLY AND FIXING TESTING & COMMITIONING NO 6 300 1800
8x8” CAST IRON GRATINGS
WORK TOTEL AMOUNT 175400 |
NOTE: price of the balance 6” PVC pipe that is keptatthe | MTR | 6 700 4200 w
site
GRAND TOTAL AMOUNT 179600 |
SATHYAN KP
plumbing contractor ECHA)
TIUMANG & Senllary works
kozhikode. mob. 9847984049 Three Stas L,n-ﬁ,f S.K. Tes Wwie Road

300 l.
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ANILS

SREE SATHIMUPPATTIAMMAL

KAKKOD3I P.O

PIN 673 611
PHONE 9043880218 DAT7E : 01:09:2021

8ol ¢8068E=@8 o oeniloty AUBLE 1O

20O ealnId 210dRIW] eHhiegElo mlmy (Rs.51,200/)

G3em)
@OMDaI07 MO o0 %(ogm&c‘)’ O)al &151 ceniowlajlolenymmy.

v

af)am.

il @RM G800

ﬁn;&“ >
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SATHYAN K.P
KARAKKATTUPOYIL
CHEVAYUR

KOZHIKODE -17 Date: 01.09.21

Al NwmdM emoegs o Jenilo) audsslend
BI2N2OW elNIB 21>d=w)) ¢doeg= e mImY Rs 50000/-
@RMl® 1Moo ©4n1®0S 2145 (cheque No.56093)

151 ceniow o fleeeam,.

af)am

MO/ 0d ol

TR of]
ﬁ &J :VEN! 7
100 INDIA
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4

SUBRAMANIAN c.p

CHERUKUNNU PARAMBIL

PAINKANNUR

KUTTIPURAM Date : 15.09.21

—_— _

Sl lwmdmy CHIex% 0l Soimeloisal  aiemlwyes
S22V eoinId 2ndmyw) Ctheg=lm mlmY (Rs 44 ,500//-

mamu@ﬂmamowﬂmmﬂmm&o ot DB 210000
& 151 eenidw o 1@ ee,m

qenimem b "\



RiG®d o)

allans@el (anmav)
asnosies ol
aougsmo!l () w

saovigesns Phone - 9846968822 Date 14 62021

10 Cdhoe8 =D o2IMmadmy alem]
02O USHWI@ d)elwow Rs.10000/- aolmdo@loo

O)al &151 cenuowlaflelee)om).

ag) . He®ad ol

BN <
' ““ g ‘



SUBRAMANIAN C.P

CHERUKUNNU PARAMBIL

PAINKANNUR

KUTTIPURAM Date : 14.06.21

Ol dd0llwmdm  esdegElcd ooimejaisal 6ooo 1003

22O ealenid 2100200 esieggled amlmi  (Rs 60000/
@R I0 MO0 ©nl®P6S 21 (cheque No.560686) &S]

cenowlaflolesnym)



SUBRAMANIAN C.P
CHERUKUNNU PARAMBIL
PAINKANNUR
KUTTIPURAM

Date : 21.06.21

SR o TR

62182 IsOT Alem 1S

ot by cH06E3 1@
eynmO] eelenid 2320 edHIeaE 1@ ol (Rs 60000/7
©Qn @30S 0olds (cheque No.560687)

@Ol MmO 1o
151 conioWof1@ 1860,




Date; 24.06.21
Ol mdm) edoege o adosnilowy Qs e 3
BIN2DW 6aINId 213dErws) CdhIegeE @ almy |
«sroogn_:m’]m@gmamﬂrom’]mogm&d 0 lWOS 6
(cheque No.560689) & 151 conIoW o fl@ o6 m),

Rs 63600/~
old

)M

MO(MD O *—*—

‘ s
Q Tl




Date; 30.06.21

Ol llawmmY e d6xe o adotniloty QIS &(D

0]
8OVAOW cainid 21Dz emdegElm MM (Rs 58000/~
GRMalO0 10OV P ©nl®)0s Aalds (cheque No.560688)
151 cennwlafl@)enymy

a)m

QLM HYAID O e

sf\ VARUNKVMHR

\\‘X
\
\
\

) I (REVENUE
\J (100 P=ETE A IND
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Date; 25.06.21

(12w MM ¢ 2e8H 1@ qomnilot) UIBGE O
2202w Galenid 210dRIW] edhregeled aflay Rs 58000/
BRM IO 10OV 10 Bal®es ealds (cheque No.560690)
& 151 cenioWlof1@ lee)m.

G

M@ 00 o adl
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Vengeri, Calicut-673 010, Ph: 9895201429, 984655443°

7\

Providente womens CoVee Malaposombs:  pate

= - _ o paté--
oY K Mbawr:'
. 00
warer Tany C\eon‘m%, o0
\aa 3180 7
ey  Ylore concvedv- \wWuyk l
one ooy C ernemt
\w/erk | :
ey dine (pameny ) e Comacting \g o0 *°°
\\ne Remooviﬂ%
Motoy 36&““3 and Wakey Tomy. Setbioy | 700°° ©
Yalivu ;;*;,“\ sl Tap 1'ne S@kk;’“(‘) qoa .00
Tane Top MO\ \Wok oo - ©°
Tang  Plastesing  WoOTK L.obour Looo 00
Cement Sand \-o &\m\ \obouy {700 - c©
Leck. Proof  wWewk 200 o0
water Vime Re = conactiny
9oo~co
pan bol  Coves Setm® )/
Open wel C\Q,a'ning E;i% 5500 .00
4mall 3508000
Ve : N\\
‘, _; “\ ( 3&"'30\00

- 2300
For vengeri plumbing Entc o8 _?\
wr ~

| 7 i
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PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE

CALICUT -673 009 ;
Date..ﬁtﬂiﬁ/:@.......

Received with thanks fromPﬂ“”w‘j,whw&mw[%m}(ﬂ%ﬁw

...................................................................................................................................................
..........................

..............

...............................................................................................................................................................................

Dy, CK Peethambrsan

£ ety of Resgory KD
SR A2) Sasthamrguless pO
Th voveesdheapoan |
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PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE

CALICUT -673 009
oate. 2|22 /21
Received with thanks from....... %’F"’C‘QPQ-Q ‘med@@fwj ....... Callesg......

wresssnsssarannn

<o Clakear  and  Ulhde.  mgax ek

........................................................................................................................................................................

.............................................................................................................................................................................

Iow. <8 -Qqut:zpc{’aqo
Fomwdieimbich < TeRr)

[ e

W bR L L, S‘”ﬂm‘aj“‘[“@ p.o

PRAID
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OTTOTRACTIONS

AKG ROAD, EDAPPALLY TOLL, KOCHI-682 024, KERALA.
PHONE: 0484-2540130

RECEIPT COSTCENTRE:  “Tosout vy’

Rupeesinwords.........é\m...... J. WA 2

SeANCELLEG P

=" Authorised Signatory


SINI
Highlight


PH

' ANl Oy,
_, W)
6M. Moagy, eilaloouy

G360 ‘,./
R A L T > T Lo Ty :,_;' D8l qvowm,
{ . t O J6H)
\J ( "y b A\ Y Iue ‘ 5 ﬂJD&B:GITgmjam‘)'_




e

=
AD-MEDIA 602972 o
E-mail: galgisackroTor ail.com

A, CALICUT - 673 009

3 CASH BILL ’
' [ Date....é....:..é...l'_%?.d-lj\
) AN 062/\441“ Nom gm.cl..... (//9? he Caﬁ;c,%?ﬁ“ ...............
7
‘."'y Particulars Sq.ft. Rate Amount
(/DJLZ\W /Z
WL oAy
bo o
Ot /’7@“’4
/
Amount @‘C&ﬁ/-—-—“
Advance ¢ ¢
Total 5‘_,9 C)/ LA
: ' f
RUDPEES I WOTAS ...oooervvesiosersssssssssssssse s Signature

iU rnree uihy .
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N “NCE WOMEN’ ,.
~& i@”f’ﬁ A

& CALICUT -673 009
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_£ WOMEN’S COlccshE ©

CALICUT -673 009 ,
| ’ Date.&@:.lb:.&,i
~d with thanks from Y% w\,Q,\@oJ ......... BSSR—— e
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Kool

. san uydldmam PS Val’lel‘ S © ayurveda
KOTTAKKAL
Kotlakkal Kanhirapuzha Herb Garden  Koltappuram Garden Kanjikode
Tel: 04832742216 Tel: 04924-238223 Tel: 0466-2266388  Tel:0491-2566004, 0491-2567535

Cash Bill issued for the sales of Medicinal Plants, seeds and Compost
from Arya Vaidya Sala Herb Gardens.

Head of Account: Medicinal Garden Income - Not taxable. £

BilNox ] 7 96 Date@/g/# S (C/;]{g“']

Place of Sale : Kottakkal/Kanhirapuzha/Kottappuram/Kanjikode

Name & Address: P’b‘o widemls Wimewa Co U'a’ﬂ‘d‘ | I
IEII('). Particulars Rate Number S:? - Ps. - j‘
I |dMe dueraned pla-i
m%@ y P P4 ol [do |ao int Hithad 1
/ Ps.| Remarks J
5 6 W | Te | B
W / -
S
i , :
TOTAL ¥ Q bo | B
N _— [
\L:;:\- Athorised Sj gnatory

I

8 | ._ /"‘ | N@v,} %&

& / Signature

3. | FAFIKK XOQ e / Designation
4. | fafed / Misc. /
%l / Total ® Rs. 4/ »LE %

—

Authorised Signatory

SUBJECT TO CALICUT JURISDICTION
This is a Ci m:ﬁuter Generated Invoice
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Vaidyaratnam P.S. Varier’s

<ARYA VAIDYA SALA |

KOTTAKKAL

b Garden Kotle A;.p\mmu;rf 2N
Tel:0491-2566004, 0491-2567535
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A Original

RCH

Kanjikode
rala

Tel: 0466-2266368
2e0e200 (one3)

lants, seeds and Compost

d for the sales of Medicinal P
ala Herb Gardens. I_

2| Garden Income - Nol taxable.

Al

Date: \ \\Ogl\q_

B ca\")ﬂk )
place of Sa l\otmif!\nlfKunhiramvlm/l(otlappurarn/Kanjllmde N
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lv—‘::.:_- . S y
| 1 Mgt PSSl ol 32,1 2204 -
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| -'/1/
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2. T T9 UH / NHM

P A
S B
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"" d 2
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No. ‘/O o8

g e Yt

CASH MEMO

(Govt. Approved)

RANDUPLACKAL HORTICULTURAL NURSERY

Avadukka.P.O, Peruvannamuzhi.Via

Kozhikode-673528

Mob: 9446668879, 9446865899

He Original

RCH

rala

Dateﬂ:ﬁl.g[.ll-.

To
Name:.. 2. 0GP 73 Bavideu.. Gl 2. t {é? /g] }7
Address:...... l'('~='2—k"l"’\"“"l.’/L .......................................................................... S A St
Sl. Particulars Qty Rate fy—
No. Rs. Ps Rs. Ps j_
] o
%Qa agn&% lO | (bo 6o 0 nt Hithad
Ps. Remarks
s’
J) dale
IZA otal | LY.
RUPEES....covrveriiamriceceneieisessereren C‘}\ _____________________
/ ................................... r—', . % . l .............. —
Signature
We ensure quahty for better product e
ol. INU e = o ; ue l\"lty %‘QAK
1. HMART ®H / General Farm // QSC‘
2. o9 T TH / NHM _ﬁ% - BT [ Signature
3. % df % / KVK QO 0
9q-H / Designation
4. | fafeer / misc, / g
%1 / Total & Rs. /2 4 50
—_—

SUBJECT TO CALICUT JURISDICTION

NV

Authorised Signatory
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BACK TO TOP

4 NSTITUTE OF SPICES RESEARST
ﬂcﬁ% ar aquhf\‘/l?rllﬁu[m P.O., HifgeTe Kozhikode - 673 012, %¥et Kerala

war / Address Pyovei 15— CQ%‘(/QUJ’Q ______ ¢ o )

. : ToaT T T Rate A Amount FHithae
—;ﬁ Particulars Qy. | ®Rs. 9Ps| ®Rs. UPs.| Remarks
Glorcannsa g | o] | Wo |-
ﬂ’” SPNM’( 2 9¢ 60—
Clove 42 |
i //
T / Total : 3
®q¢ / Rupees w / (}4 5\OT o
7T / Booking g
j T i |4 g
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Printed on 3-Aug-2017 at 10:40

/4 Tax Invoice

y

" JALJIT PAINTS & HARDWARES( Invoice No. Dated

V' 1/1274A1,KANNUR ROAD 11245 -

CALICUT-673011 1 ﬁ""“g'zoﬂ
0447061798/7012234941 ode/Terms of Payment
GSTIN/UIN: 32AJAP80575P1ZW Supplier !
E-Mail : jaijitpaints@gmail.com poliets Bet Other Reference(s)
Consignee Buyer's Order No. Dated
PROVIDANCE COLLEGE '
MALAPRAMBA Terms of Delivery
CALICUT

Kerala, Code : 32

Buyer (if other than consignee)
PROVIDANCE COLLEGE
BOTINY DEPARTMENT

CALICUT
Kerala, Code : 32

Sl Description of Goods
No. HSN/SAC = Quantity Rate per Amount
VOLCANO - 0578 - 4 '
| 1z 3TOP e e 2nos 115231 nos 230462
9603 : 4 nos 75.00! nos ,300.03
g /260462
SGST 4 349.65
Round Off r 4 - 349.65
; . 0.08
‘. ! T | : / ‘ } /
Amount Chargeable (in words) e ‘ ”/6 s | 3 |
| &£3,304.00
INR Three Thousand Three Hundred Four Only E &OE
/’l/// ‘
N
Company's PAN : AJAPS0575P //
4'/./
/

Customer's Seal and Signature
for JAI JIT PAINTS & @3@}53
I\

Thi§ is a.C' m}uter Generated Invoice




1/1274A1,KANNUR ROAD

CALICUT-673011
0447061798/701 2234941
GSTIN/UIN: 32AJAPSO575P1ZW
E-Mail : jaijitpaints@gmall.com

Supplier's Ref.

G ed on 9-Aug-2017 at 10:20

Tax Invoice
BACK TO TOP
JAI JIT PAINTS & HARDWARES Invoice No. » T
JJ362 9-Aug-2017

Mode/Terms of Payment

' Other Reference(s)

- Buyer's Order No. Dated
Consignee =
PROVIDANCE COLLEG Tt e
MALAPRAMBA s of Delivery
CALICUT
Kerala, Code : 32
Buyer (if other than consignee)
BOTINY DEPARTMENT
MALAPRAMBA .
CALICUT |
a1 Description of Goods . HSN/SAC  Quantity Rate | per Amount 1
'No.| | _
'1 VOLCANO - 0578 -4 LTR 13209 2nos 1 149.32! - |
- | SILENT NIGHT - 8254 -1 LTR 13209 2nos  257.81 nos 2’232'2‘;
3 WHT0050 APCO ADVANCE GLOSS ENNML 1 LTR 3208 1 nos 234_38; nos 234l38
‘ 3,048.64
gﬁg; 426.81
- 3 425.81
; Round Off (-)0.26
- Total
' Amount Chargeable (in words) 5 nos| ¥ 3,902.00
INR Three Thousand Nine Hundred Two Only "
: HSN/SAC
: Taxable Central Tax State Tax
5309 2 1. Value Rate Amount Rate Amount
2508 2,814.26 14% 394.00 14% | 394.00/
= 234.38 14% 32.81 14% 32.81
otal 3,048.64 426.81 426.81

Tax Amount (in words) : INR Eight Hundred Fifty Three and Sixty Two paise Only

Company's PAN : AJAPS0575P

| Declaration _
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the gdods described and that all particulars a

This is a Computer Generated Invoice

" for JAI JIT PAINTS HARDWARES |

re true and correct.

Authierisel Signatory
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PPROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE
CALICUT = 673 009
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PROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE

CALICUT -673 009
Bavoivad With IRENKS FIOM cecsmsswssssmsssmssssmsmassossssensinmsas
the sum of Rupees....... /[Lﬁdqﬁi‘owfw/auﬂ/gquﬂw%a/
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YPROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE
' CALICUT - 673 009




149(5(1F

PPROVIDENCE WOMEN’S COLLEGE,
' CALICUT - 673 009




BACK TO TOP

RECEIPT

rom the principal, Providence Women'’s College, Calicut — 9, a

Received f
f Rupees Thirty Thousand Only (Rs. 30,000/-) towards the expenses of
sum O

HERBAL GARDEN for the Botany department.

Date: ——
DR. DEENA MERIA JOSE

Signature : M s
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1/12/23, 10:37 AM Providence Women's College Kozhikode Mail - Your Order at www.story cessful

pwc library <pwclibrary@priS6S52a legecalicut.ac.in>

Your Order at www.storytel.com/in is successful

payment-report@payu.in <payment-report@payu.in> Thu, Jan 12, 2023 at 10:34 AM
Reply-To: "payment-report@payu.in" <payment-report@payu.in>
To: pwclibrary@providencecollegecalicut.ac.in

Paylf

Transaction ID: d9f689eb-6080-
4106-bdeb-f10d9fca6021

Rs. 999.00 Paid to
www.storytel.com/in

via upi on 12 Jan 2023 10:34 AM

Here are your transaction details:

Bank Reference Number 301207296214

Payment Gateway HDFCU Sl
For any product/service query, please contact
www.storytel.com/in.

Since, this is an automated email, replying to this will not connect you with us.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=742b9d8493&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A17547917804886812408&simpl=msg-f%3A1754791780... 1/2


http://www.storytel.com/in
http://www.storytel.com/in
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1/12/23, 10:37 AM Providence Women's College Kozhikode Mail - Your Order at www.story cessful

Thank you for completing your transaction using PayU's payment services. Your data will c per our

Privacy Policy. Please click here to edit your preferences.
BACK TO TOP

© Copyright 2021, PayU. All rights are reserved.

Click here to unsubscribe

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=742b9d8493&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A17547917804886812408&simpl=msg-f%3A1754791780... 2/2


http://alerttrackmo.actionmile.co.in/eapptranscom/index.php/display/U/?C=1023795726&E=257743150
https://payu.in/privacy-policy?trackingId=091effa16226fbcb21ed2005e0af96cb&email=pwclibrary@providencecollegecalicut.ac.in&channel=Email
https://payu.in/privacy-policy?trackingId=091effa16226fbcb21ed2005e0af96cb&email=pwclibrary@providencecollegecalicut.ac.in&channel=Email#quiz14

. 2
Puovidence Women's College
Re-Accredited with A+ Grade by NAAC
* R Principal  :  0495-2371697

Office - (0495-2371696, 2372487 CARMEL HILL
Resi . 0495-2371059 MALAPARAMBA (P.O.)
E-mal  : providencecollegecalicut@gmail.com CALICUT - 673 009
Website www.providencecollegecalicul.ac.in

CERTIFICATE

R hereby certify that the documents submitted above for 7.1.2
have been verified with the departments concerned and office

documents and found true to the best of my knowledge.

Dr. Sr. Jagegena Joseph
Principal (PEN 470173)
Providence Women's College
Kozhikode - 673 009
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